Price Per Unit Price  Total Extended
Item # Description stimated Usag Brand Pack Size 0z. Per Case Price
SCHEDULE Il - FRUIT JUICE,100% , BOTTLED, 12 OZ.
Apple 250 | Tropicana 12 $0.10 $14.92 Dole 24 $0.08 $18.56 $4,640.00
Fruit Punch 150|Welchs 24 $0.08 $24.02 Dole 24 $0.77 $18.56 $2,784.00
Grape 100| Tropicana 12 $0.10 $14.92 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Kiwi Strawberry, Ohana or Equal 125|Welchs 24 $0.08 $24.02 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Orange Jucie 200| Tropicana 12 $0.10 $14.92 Dole 24 $0.08 $18.56 $3,712.00
10 oz. Minute Maid: Apple Juice and Orange Juice 200|NA NA $0.00 $0.00 NA NA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
$0.00
SCHEDULE Il - CANNED FLAVORED FRUIT DRINKS, 12 OZ.
Fruit Punch, Ohana or Equal 1200 |Ohana 12 $0.02 $3.56 $4,272.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Lemonade, Ohana or Equal 850|0Ohana 12 $0.02 $3.56 $3,026.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Lemon Tea, Ohana or Equal 500|Ohana 12 $0.02 $3.56 $1,780.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Kiwi Strawberry, Ohana or Equal 1200|Ohana 12 $0.02 $3.56 $4,272.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
$13,350.00 $0.00
SCHEDULE IV - SPORTS DRINKS, 12 - 20 OZ.
Blue Raspberry, Gatorade or Equal 50|Gatorade 24 $0.035 $16.90 Gatorade 24 $0.05 $14.72 $736.00
Ice Punch, Gatorade or Equal 50|Gatorade 24 $0.035 $16.90 Gatorade 24 $0.05 $14.72 $736.00
Lemon-Lime, Gatorade or Equal 50|Gatorade 24 $0.035 $16.90 Gatorade 24 $0.05 $14.72 $736.00
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Gatorade G2, Fruit Punch 50 |Gatorade 24 $0.035 $16.90 $845.00 Gatorade 24 $0.05 $14.72 $736.00
Gatorade G2, Grape 50|Gatorade 24 $0.035 $16.90 $845.00 Gatorade 24 $0.05 $14.72 $736.00
Gatorade G2, Orange 50|Gatorade 24 $0.035 $16.90 $845.00 Gatorade 24 $0.05 $14.72 $736.00
20 oz. Powerade Zero: Fruit Punch, Mixed Berry, Grape 50|NA NA $0.000 $0.00 $0.00 NA NA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
12 oz. Powerade: All Flavors 50|NA NA $0.000 $0.00 $0.00 NA NA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

$5,070.000 $4,416.00

SCHEDULE V- MEGA SPORTS, 16.9 - 20 OZ.

Berry, Propel Fitness Water, Mega Sports or Equal 275|Gatorade 24 $0.05 $21.65 $5,953.75 Propel 24 $0.07 $31.23 $8,588.25
Black Cherry, Propel or Equal 50| Gatorade 24 $0.05 $21.65 $1,082.50 Propel 24 $0.07 $31.24 $1,562.00
Blue Pom, Propel or Equal 50|Gatorade 24 $0.05 $21.65 $1,082.50 Propel 24 $0.07 $31.24 $1,562.00
Fruit Punch, Mega Sports or Equal 50| Propel 24 $0.05 $21.65 $1,082.50 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Grape, Mega Sports or Equal 50 |Propel 24 $0.05 $21.65 $1,082.50 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Strawberry Watermelon, Mega Sports or Equal 50 |Propel 24 $0.05 $21.65 $1,082.50 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Kiwi Strawberry, Propel Fitness Water or Equal 50 |Propel 6 $0.05 $5.02 $251.00 Propel 24 $0.07 $31.24 $1,562.00
Lemon-Lime, Mega Sports or Equal 200|Mega Sport 24 $0.07 $34.32 $6,864.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Lemon, Propel Fitness Water or Equal 50 |Propel 6 $0.05 $5.02 $251.00 Propel 24 $0.07 $31.24 $1,562.00
Orange, Mega Sports, or Equal 50|Mega Sport 24 $0.07 $34.32 $1,716.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Peach Mango, Propel or Equal 50 |Propel 6 $0.05 $5.02 $251.00 Propel 24 $0.07 $31.24 $1,562.00

$20,699.25 $16,398.25

SCHEDULE VII - PLAIN WATER, BOTTLED, 16.9 OZ., MIN.
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32500 $0.000

Water, Bottled 5000|Pure Life 30 0.01835 6.5
SCHEDULE VII - ENHANCED WATER, 16.9 -20 OZ.
Black & Blueberry, Sobe Life Water or Equal 50|Sobe 12 0.06215 14.92
Citrus Punch, Fortified w/Vitamins, A,C & E, Tampico Plus, or Equal 100|Sunny D 12 0.0602 11.55
Mango Melon, Sobe Life Water or Equal 50|Sobe 24 0.12595 60.46
Mango , Fortified w/Vitamins A,C, & E, Tampico or Equal 100|Sunny D 12 0.0602 11.25
20 oz. Vitamin Water Zero: All Flavors 100|NA NA 0 0
16.9 oz. Vitamin Water Zero: All Flavors 100|NA NA 0 0
SCHEDULE VIIl - WATER, FLAVORED, BOTTLED, 16.9 - 20 OZ.
Cherry Blast, Clear Fruit or Equal 400 |Clear Fruit 12 0.0473 11.35
Grape, Aquafina Splash 100|Aqua Fina 6 0.0473 11.35
Red Raspberry, Clear Fruit or Equal 350|Clear Fruit 12 0.056 5.68
Kiwi Strawberry, Aquafina Splash, Clear Fruit or Equal 850|Aqua Fina 12 0.0814 16.5
Lemon , Acquifina Splash, Clear Fruit or Equal 50|Aqua Fina 12 0.0814 16.5
Lime, Clear Fruit or Equal 50| Clear Fruit 12 0.0473 11.35
Peach Fling 50| Clear Fruit 12 0.0473 11.35
Strawberry Watermelon, Clear Fruit or Equal 500 | Clear Fruit 12 0.0473 11.35

Food

Aqua Fina 24 $0.02 $6.00 $30,000.00
$0.00

Sobe 12 $0.05 $11.50 $575.00
NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
SOBE 12 $0.05 $11.50 $575.00
NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
$1,150.00

NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Aqua Fina 24 $0.03 $11.98 $1,198.00
NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Aqua Fina 24 $0.03 $11.98 $10,183.00
Aqua Fina 24 $0.03 $11.98 $599.00
NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
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Wildberry, Aquafina Splash, or Equal 100|Aqua Fina 12 0.0644 13.07 1307 Aqua Fina 24 $0.03 $11.98 $1,198.00

20 oz. Dasani Flavors: Strawberry, Lemon NA NA 0 0 0 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

$13,178.00

SCHEDULE IX - CARBONATED, 100% FRUIT JUICE, MIN., 8.3 0Z., MIN., FDA

Apple, Hardcore, Switch or Equal 100 |Switch 24 $0.13 $25.34 $2,534.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Fruit Punch, Switch or Equal 200 | Switch 24 $0.14 $28.25 $5,650.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Grape, Switch or Equal 100|Switch 24 $0.14 $28.25 $2,825.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Kiwi Berry, Switch or Equal 100 |Switch 24 $0.14 $28.25 $2,825.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Lemon-Lime, Switch or Equal 100|Switch 24 $0.14 $28.25 $2,825.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Orange Tangerine, Switch or Equal 100|Switch 24 $0.14 $28.25 $2,825.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

SCHEDULE X - NATURALLY BREWED TEA, 16 - 20 OZ., WITH NATURAL ING|

Peach Flavored, Tea, Plastic Bottle 100 |Sweet Leaf 12 $0.06 $14.78 $1,478.00 NO BID #REF! $0.00 $0.00
Tea, Lemon Flavored, Tradwinds Brand or Equal, Plastic Bottle 100 |Sweet Leaf 12 $0.06 $14.78 $1,478.00 NO BID #REF! $0.00 $0.00
Tea, Green w/Honey, Tradwinds Brand or Equal, Plastic Bottle 100| Tradwinds 12 $0.06 $13.99 $1,399.00 NO BID #REF! $0.00 $0.00
Tea, Raspberry, Tradwinds Brand or Equal, Plastic Bottle 100| Tradwinds 12 $0.06 $13.99 $1,399.00 NO BID #REF! $0.00 $0.00
Sweet Tea, Tradwinds Brand or Equal, Plastic Bottle 100 | Tradwinds 12 $0.06 $13.99 $1,399.00 NO BID #REF! $0.00 $0.00
Unsweeten Tea, Tradwinds Brand or Equal, Plastic Bottle 100 | Tradwinds 12 $0.06 $13.99 $1,399.00 Pure Leaf 12 $0.06 $12.60 $1,260.00

SCHEDULE XI - LEMONADE, 16 OZ. , WITH NATURAL INGREDIENTS
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Lemonade, Blackberry, w/Real Lemon Bits, Not More than 120 Calori

200

NO BID

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

Food

NO BID

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00
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Unit

Price Per Unit Price  Total Extended Price PFr’i(;:re Total Extended
Brand Pack Size oz. Per Case Price Brand Pack Size Per oz. Case Price

NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 Everfresh 24 $0.05 $15.15 $3,787.50
NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 Everfresh 24 $0.05 $15.15 $2,272.50
NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 Everfresh 24 $0.05 $15.15 $1,515.00
NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 Everfresh 24 $0.05 $15.15 $1,893.75
NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 Everfresh 24 $0.05 $15.15 $3,030.00
Min. Maid 24 $0.06 $14.16 $2,832.00 NA NA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
$2,832.00 $12,498.75

NO BID $0.00 $0.00 24 $0.03 $8.36 $10,032.00
NO BID $0.00 $0.00 24 $0.03 $8.36 $7,106.00
NO BID $0.00 $0.00 24 $0.03 $8.36 $4,180.00
NO BID $0.00 $0.00 24 $0.35 $8.36 $10,032.00
$0.00

NO BID $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.000 $0.00 $0.00
NO BID $0.00 $0.00 Mega Sport 24 $0.043 $12.48 $624.00
NO BID $0.00 $0.00 Mega Sport 24 $0.043 $12.48 $624.00

Food
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NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 Mega Sport 24 $0.043 $12.48 $624.00
NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 Mega Sport 24 $0.043 $12.48 $624.00
NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 Mega Sport 24 $0.043 $12.48 $624.00
Powerade O 24 $0.03 $17.04 $852.00 NA NA $0.000 $0.00 $0.00
Powerade 24 $0.04 $11.76 $588.00 NA NA $0.000 $0.00 $0.00
$3,120.00

NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 Mega Sport 24 $0.03 $16.08 $4,422.00
NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 Mega Sport 24 $0.03 $16.08 $804.00
NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 Mega Sport 24 $0.03 $16.08 $804.00
NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 Mega Sport 24 $0.03 $16.08 $3,216.00
NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 Mega Sport 24 $0.03 $16.08 $804.00
NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
$10,050.00

Food
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Dasani 24 $0.02 $7.92 $39,600.00 $0.00 Mr. Pure 24 $0.02 $7.32 $36,600.00
NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Vit. Water 24 $0.04 $22.56 $2,256.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Vit. Water 24 $0.04 $18.00 $1,800.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

$4,056.00 $0.00
NO BID $0.00 $0.00 Clear Fruit 24 $0.04 $14.30 $5,720.00
NO BID $0.00 $0.00 Clear Fruit 24 $0.04 $14.30 $1,430.00
NO BID $0.00 $0.00 Clear Fruit 24 $0.04 $14.30 $5,005.00
NO BID $0.00 $0.00 Clear Fruit 24 $0.04 $14.30 $12,155.00
NO BID $0.00 $0.00 Clear Fruit 24 $0.04 $14.30 $715.00
NO BID $0.00 $0.00 Clear Fruit 24 $0.04 $14.30 $715.00
NO BID $0.00 $0.00 Clear Fruit 24 $0.04 $14.30 $715.00
NO BID $0.00 $0.00 Clear Fruit 24 $0.04 $14.30 $7,150.00

Food
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NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 Clear Fruit 24 $0.04 $14.30 $1,430.00
Dasani 24 $0.02 $10.08 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
$35,035.00

NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 Switch 24 $0.08 $15.60 $1,560.00
NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 Switch 24 $0.08 $15.60 $3,120.00
NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 Switch 24 $0.08 $15.60 $1,560.00
NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 Switch 24 $0.08 $15.60 $1,560.00
NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 Switch 24 $0.08 $15.60 $1,560.00
NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 Switch 24 $0.08 $15.60 $1,560.00
$10,920.00

NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 Tradewinds 12 $0.05 $12.50 $1,250.00
NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 Tradewinds 12 $0.05 $12.50 $1,250.00
NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 Tradewinds 12 $0.05 $12.50 $1,250.00
NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 Tradewinds 12 $0.05 $12.50 $1,250.00
NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 Tradewinds 12 $0.05 $12.50 $1,250.00
NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 Tradewinds 12 $0.05 $12.50 $1,250.00
$7,500.00

Food
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NO BID

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

Food

NO BID

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00
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